

**Gallup-McKinley County Schools**  
**PROCUREMENT DEPARTMENT -- TABULATION SHEET(S)**  
 BID NO. ITB-328-18WF      BID ON: Paper MP Index

Open Date: October 25, 2017 at 2:00 P.M. (Local)

Item No.	Items and Descriptions	Quantity	Sandia Paper Co.	Desert Paper & Envelope Co.	Veritiv Operating Co.	Quill Corporation	Contract Paper Group	Butler's Office Equipment & Supply		
	<b><u>SECTION A: R&amp;D Warehouse Stock</u></b>									
1	Multi-Purpose/Copy Paper Letter Size, 8.5" x 11", 500 sheets/ream Domtar # or Equal									
	Green	600 Ream	3.87 2,322.00	5.06 3,036.00	3.75 2,250.00	5.24 3,144.00	3.80 2,280.00	4.39 2,634.00		
	Pink	550 Ream	3.87 2,128.50	5.06 2,783.00	3.75 2,062.50	5.24 2,882.00	3.80 2,090.00	4.39 2,414.50		
	Blue	620 Ream	3.87 2,399.40	5.06 3,137.20	3.75 2,325.00	5.24 3,248.80	3.80 2,356.00	4.39 2,721.80		
	Goldenrod	460 Ream	3.87 1,780.20	5.06 2,327.60	3.75 1,725.00	5.24 2,410.40	3.80 1,748.00	4.39 2,019.40		
	Canary Yellow	620 Ream	3.87 2,399.40	5.06 3,137.20	3.75 2,325.00	5.24 3,248.80	3.80 2,356.00	4.39 2,721.80		
	Buff	150 Ream	3.87 580.50	5.06 759.00	3.75 562.50	5.24 786.00	3.80 570.00	4.39 658.50		
	<b>TOTAL ITEM NO. 1</b>		<b>\$ 11,610.00</b>	<b>\$ 15,180.00</b>	<b>\$ 11,250.00</b>	<b>\$ 15,720.00</b>	<b>\$ 11,400.00</b>	<b>\$ 13,170.00</b>		
			\$ 11,029.50	\$ 14,421.00	\$ 10,687.50			\$ 12,511.50		
2	Multi-Purpose/Copy Paper, Legal Size 8.5" x 14", 500 sheets/ream Domtar # or Equal									
	White	150 Ream	4.19 628.50	4.71 706.50	5.13 769.50	6.62 993.00	5.50 825.00	4.39 658.50		
	Green	30 Ream	5.78 173.40	6.76 202.80	5.13 153.90	11.99 359.70	5.50 165.00	5.83 174.90		

**Gallup-McKinley County Schools**  
**PROCUREMENT DEPARTMENT -- TABULATION SHEET(S)**  
 BID NO. ITB-328-18WF      BID ON: Paper MP Index

Open Date: October 25, 2017 at 2:00 P.M. (Local)

Item No.	Items and Descriptions	Quantity	Sandia Paper Co.	Desert Paper & Envelope Co.	Veritiv Operating Co.	Quill Corporation	Contract Paper Group	Butler's Office Equipment & Supply		
	Pink	20 Ream	5.78 115.60	6.76 135.20	5.13 102.60	11.99 239.80	5.50 110.00	5.83 116.60		
	Blue	50 Ream	5.78 289.00	6.76 338.00	5.13 256.50	11.99 599.50	5.50 275.00	5.83 291.50		
	Goldenrod	25 Ream	5.78 144.50	6.76 169.00	5.13 128.25	No Bid	5.50 137.50	5.83 145.75		
	Canary Yellow	15 Ream	5.78 86.70	6.76 101.40	5.13 76.95	11.99 179.85	5.50 82.50	5.83 87.45		
	Ivory Cream	40 Ream	5.78 231.20	6.76 270.40	5.13 205.20	11.99 479.60	5.50 220.00	5.83 233.20		
	<b>TOTAL ITEM NO. 2</b>		<b>\$ 1,668.90</b>	<b>\$ 1,923.30</b>	<b>\$ 1,692.90</b>	<b>\$ 2,851.45</b>	<b>\$ 1,815.00</b>	<b>\$ 1,707.90</b>		
			\$ 1,585.46	\$ 1,827.14	\$ 1,608.26			\$ 1,622.51		
3	Index Paper, Letter Size 8.5" x 11", 110 Lb., 250 sheets/ream, Domtar # or Equal									
	White	300 Ream	5.86 1,758.00	6.22 1,866.00	5.85 1,755.00	No Bid	5.88 1,764.00	7.47 2,241.00		
	Blue	125 Ream	6.44 805.00	6.55 818.75	6.18 772.50	15.19 1,898.75	6.15 768.75	7.84 980.00		
	Canary Yellow	130 Ream	6.44 837.20	6.55 851.50	6.18 803.40	15.19 1,974.70	6.15 799.50	7.84 1,019.20		
	Salmon	80 Ream	6.44 515.20	6.55 524.00	6.18 494.40	No Bid	6.15 492.00	7.84 627.20		
	Green	90 Ream	6.44 579.60	6.55 589.50	6.18 556.20	No Bid	6.15 553.50	7.84 705.60		

